Bid Tabulation

ITB 121-19R "HISTOLOGY SUPPLIES FOR COOPER GREEN MERCY HEALTH SERVICES,

(CGMHS) LAB"
Latoria Kenniebrew, Buyer
kenniebrewl@jccal.org

1

2

POLY SCIENTIFIC

MEDLINE

GRAND TOTAL

$

3,666.80000

$

3,150.00380

APPROVED EQUAL

1 BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

MICROSCOPE SLIDE LABELS, 15/16" X 15/16", STD THICKNESS IMPRINTED PATHOLOGY

WHITE & COLORS LEICA BIOSYSTEMS #02025 OR

NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

DECALCIFIER Il 6 QTS/CASE #00421 LEICA BIOSYSTEMS, NO SUBSTITUTE

2 BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

AZER SCIENTIFIC

AZRES734

12CS

12CS

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

$ 268.10 | $

22.3417

CLEARIUM MOUNTING MEDIA 4/CASE

3 BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

#01101 LEICA BIOSYSTEMS, NO SUBSTITUTE

AZER SCIENTIFIC

AZRES726

6 CS

6 CS

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

$ 23862 | $

39.7700

BUFFERED NEUTRAL FORMALIN 30ML

4 BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

CONTAINERS 50/CS. #0070 LEICA BIOSYSTEMS

MEDLINE

MCHEMPF40

256 CS

256 CS

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

$ 8292]$

0.3239

5 BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

STA-ON TISSUE SECTION ADHESIVE PT. #03105 LEICA BIOSYSTEMS

NO BID

STATLAB MEDICAL PRODUCTS

STLB47

1PT

1PT

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

23.31

23.31

MICROSCOPE SLIDES X-TRA WHITE #00210 LEICA BIOSYSTEMS

6 BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

GLOBE SCIENTIFIC INC

DLS1358W

1440 CS

1440 CS

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

238.17

0.1654

FROSTBITE, #03100 LEICA BIOSYSTEMS

7 BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

AZER SCIENTIFIC

AZRRAP-FRZ

12 CS

12 CS

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

$ 136.39 | $

11.3658

CASSETTES, BLUE 15-182-500D LEICA BIOSYSTEMS

g BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

NO BID

NO BID

CASSETTES, GREEN 15-182-500C LEICA BIOSYSTEMS

9 BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

NO BID

NO BID

CASSETTES, WHITE 22-038203 LEICA BI

OSYSTEMS

10  |BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

CASSETTES, PINK LEICA BIOSYSTEMS

11 |BRAND/STKNO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

NO BID
|

NO BID

BLUE BUFFER, | GALLON LEICA BIOSYSTEMS, NO SUBSTITUTE

12 |BRAND/STKNO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

13 BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

DEFINE CLARIFIER, 1 GALLON LEICA BIOSYSTEMS, NO SUBSTITUTE

NO BID

AZER SCIENTIFIC

AZRES771

4CS

4 CS

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

$ 137.4900 | $

34.3725

14  |BRAND/STKNO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

HEMATOXYLIN, 4 PT./CASE LEICA BIOSYSTEMS, NO SUBSTITUTE

NO BID

AZER SCIENTIFIC

AZRES36101

4CS

4CS

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

$ 103.6400 | $

25.9100

COVER SLIPS 50 X 24 X 1IMM LEICA BIOSYSTEMS

15 BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

MEDLINE

MLAB24X501

10 CS

10 CS

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

$ 21.2500 | $

2.1250
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POLY SCIENTIFIC

MEDLINE

GRAND TOTAL

$ 3,666.80000

3,150.00380

16

XYLENE (4 GALLON/CASE) LEICA BIOSYSTEMS

BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

AZER SCIENTIFIC

AZRES609

4 CS

4 CS

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

61.6700 | $

15.4175

17

ALCOHOL-ISOPROPYL (4 GALLON/CASE) LEICA BIOSYSTEMS

BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

NO BID
|

MEDLINE

MCHEM140

4Cs

4Cs

82.8600 | $

20.7150

18

CYTOLOGY FIXATIVE LEICA BIOSYSTEMS

BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

AZER SCIENTIFIC

AZRES34821

12 CS

12 CS

19

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

147.0900 | $

12.2575

BLUE RIBBON PARRAFIN LEICA BIOSYSTEMS, NO SUBSTITUTE

BRAND/STK NO

NO BID

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

NO BID
|

20

TB AURAMINE-RHODAMINE T BD #212515

BRAND/STK NO

NO BID

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

BD

BDD212515

4PK

4PK

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

146.7300 | $

36.6825

21

CYTOSTAIN, 1 PINT; #7511, THERMO FISHER SCIENTIFIC

BRAND/STK NO

NO BID

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

AZER SCIENTIFIC

AZRES720

4 CS

4 CS

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

94.9200 | $

23.7300

22

MER MARKER, PLATINUM LINE MERCEDES MEDICAL

BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

MEDLINE

MLAB140020

10 BX

10 BX

33.8300 | $

3.3830

23

PLASTIC CHAMBER, 1ML CARDINAL HEALTH # C1660-6

BRAND/STK NO

NO BID

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

SIMPORT SCIENTIFIC

SMPM9631

200 CS

200 CS

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

172.7000 | $

0.8635

24

PLASTIC CHAMBER, 1ML CAP, 200/CASE CARDINAL HEALTH #C1660-7

BRAND/STK NO

NO BID

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

SIMPORT SCIENTIFIC

SMPM965C

500 CS

500 CS

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

119.3400 | $

0.2387

25

PLASTIC CHAMBER HOLDER, 1ML, 200/CASE CARDINAL HEALTH #C-1660-9

BRAND/STK NO

NO BID

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

SIMPORT SCIENTIFIC

SMPM963B

200 CS

200 CS

158.3000 | $

0.7915

26

FILTER PAPER, 1ML, 200/CASE, ACCU E

DGE CARDINAL HEALTH #C1660-5

BRAND/STK NO

NO BID

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

SIMPORT SCIENTIFIC

SMPM963FW

200 CS

200 CS

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

40.7000 | $

0.2035

27

ALCOHOLIC EOSIN Y 515 LECIA BRAND #3801616 NO SUBSTITUTE

BRAND/STK NO

NO BID

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

AZER SCIENTIFIC

AZRES709

4CS

4CS

40.7000 | $

13.9975

28

ACCU-EDGE HIGH PROFILE BLADES SAKURA BRAND #4685 NO SUBSTITUTE

BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

AZER SCIENTIFIC

AZRES33675

50 PK

50 PK

111.6000 | $

2.2320

29

MICTOTOME WASTE COLLECTION BAGS SAKURA BRAND #4658 #M7135-10

BRAND/STK NO

NO BID

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

NO BID

30

10% BUFFERED FORMALIN NEUTRAL #

C4320-01

BRAND/STK NO

NO BID

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

MEDLINE

MCHEMPF60

256 CS

256

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

85.8600 | $

0.3354

31

DISPOSAL CHARCOAL FILTER ITEM# L53060-30B

BRAND/STK NO

PKG QTY/MIN ORDER

NO BID

PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH

NO BID
|
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POLY SCIENTIFIC MEDLINE
GRAND TOTAL $ 3,666.80000] $ 3,150.00380
THERMO SCIENTIFIC HYPERCLEAN DISPOSABLE FORMALDEHYDE FILTER, ITEM#9990612 (FOR THE THERMO SCIENTIFIC TISSUE PROCESSOR
— EXCELSIOR)
32 BRAND/STK NO NO BID LABCONCO CORP LBC3924201
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 360.2900 | $ 360.2900
PERIODIC ACID SCHIFF REACTION KIT 8 OZ. #K047 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
33 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC K047-8 OZ AZER SCIENTIFIC AZRES3400
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 5/8 0Z BOTTLES 1BOX 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 159.00000( $ 31.80000 | $ 135.2100 | $ 135.2100
CHROMIC ACID 5% #S165 16 OZ. POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
34 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S$165-16 OZ STATLAB MEDICAL PRODUCTS STLBKC0912
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/16 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 55.00000] $ 55.00000 | $ 50.3000 | $ 50.3000
HYDROCHLORIC ACID 20% 16 OZ. #S1832 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
35 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC $1832-16 OZ RICCA CHEMICAL COMPANY LLC RCCR3574500A
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/16 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 44.00000[ $ 44.00000 | $ 22.0900 | $ 22.0900
PERIODIC ACID 1% 16 OZ. #S1861 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
36 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC $1861-16 OZ STATLAB MEDICAL PRODUCTS STLBPA16
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/16 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 74.00000] $ 74.00000 | $ 25.9400 | $ 25.9400
POTASSIUM FERROCYANIDE 10% 16 OZ. #S1873 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
37 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S$1873-160Z RICCA CHEMICAL COMPANY LLC RCCR6096500A
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/16 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 62.00000] $ 62.00000 | $ 50.4200 | $ 50.4200
SODIUM BISULFITE 1% 16 OZ. POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE #S1893(
38 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S1893-16 OZ NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/16 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 30.00000| $ 30.00000 |
SODIUM THEOSULFATE 2% 16 OZ. #5280 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
39 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC $280-16 OZ NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/16 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 40.00000| $ 40.00000 |
XYLENE/ACETONE 50/50 16 OZ. #S1911 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE 0
20 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S1911-16 OZ NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/16 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 30.00000] $ 30.00000 |
ALCIAN BLUE 1% IN 3% ACETIC ACID PH 2.5 8 OZ. #S111A POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
41 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S111A-8 OZ AZER SCIENTIFIC AZRES4801
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 0Z BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 77.00000] $ 77.00000 | $ 202.9300 | $ 202.9300
POTASSIUM PERMANGANATE 0.5% AQUEOUS 8 OZ. #S263 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
42 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S263-8 0Z NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 30.00000 $ 30.00000 | |
1% SODIUM HYDROXIDE 1% AQUEOQUS 8 OZ. #51918A POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
43 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S1918A-8 OZ NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 0Z BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 18.00000| $ 18.00000 |
GLYCERINE JELLY 8 OZ. #5200 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE ]
24 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S200-8 OZ NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 31.00000| $ 31.00000 |
ACETIC ACID 0.5% AQUEOUS 8 OZ. #S2015 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
5 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S2015-8 OZ NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 0Z BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 19.00000| $ 19.00000 |
INDIA INK 1 OZ. #5223 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE (]
46 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC $223-10Z BD BDD261194
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/1 0OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 50 PK 50 PK
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 20.00000] $ 20.00000 | $ 63.3100 | $ 1.2662
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POLY SCIENTIFIC MEDLINE
GRAND TOTAL $ 3,666.80000] $ 3,150.00380
SCHIFF’S REAGENT, 160Z., #S272 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE (]
a7 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC $272-16 OZ STATLAB MEDICAL PRODUCTS STL3370016
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/16 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 77.00000] $ 77.00000 | $ 38.4800 | $ 38.4800
NUCLEAR FATT RED (KERNECKTROT) 0.1 % 8 OZ. #5248 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
48 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S248-8 OZ AZER SCIENTIFIC AZRES37032
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 0Z BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 75.00000] $ 75.00000 | $ 68.5600 | $ 68.5600
1% ACID ALCOHOL, 1 GAL #S104 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
49 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S104-1 GL AZER SCIENTIFIC AZRES36947
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/1 GAL BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 4CS 4CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 101.00000[ $ 101.00000 | $ 96.0400 | $ 24.0100
SODIUM THIOSULFATE 2% 16 OZ. #5280 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE (]
50 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S280-16 OZ NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/16 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 40.00000] $ 40.00000 |
PICRIC ACID/ACETONE 0.1 % 16 OZ. #1867 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
51 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S1867-16 OZ RICCA CHEMICAL COMPANY LLC RCC5861100500
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/16 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 51.00000[ $ 51.00000 | $ 86.7200 | $ 86.7200
1% SILVER NITRATE 8 OZ. #S2165 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
52 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S2165-8 OZ NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 62.00000] $ 62.00000 |
2 % SILVER NITRATE 8 OZ. #S2166 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE (|
53 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S2166-8 OZ NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 0Z BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 106.00000| $ 106.00000 |
5% SILVER NITRATE 8 OZ. #51890 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
54 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC $1890-8 OZ AZER SCIENTIFIC AZRES37154
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 0Z BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 204.00000( $ 204.00000 | $ 463.3800 | $ 463.3800
SODIUM BICARBONATE 5 % AQUEOUS 8 OZ. #S275 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
55 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S275-8 0Z NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 0Z BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 19.00000] $ 19.00000 |
ZIEHL-NEILSON ACIF FAST BACTERIA KIT 8 OZ. #K062 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
56 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC K062-8 OZ AZER SCIENTIFIC AZRES3405
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 3/8 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 146.00000 $ 48.67000 | $ 109.0000 | $ 109.0000
GRAMS IODINE 8 OZ. #5204 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE (|
57 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S204-8 OZ AZER SCIENTIFIC AZRES803
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 0Z BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 4CS 4CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 21.00000] $ 21.00000 | $ 46.8600 | $ 11.7150
BOUINS SOLUTION 8 OZ. #35129 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE (!
58 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC $129-8 OZ AZER SCIENTIFIC AZRES803
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 0Z BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 48 CS 48 CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 29.00000] $ 29.00000 | $ 118.2700 | $ 2.4640
'WEIGHER HEMATOXYLIN SOLUTIONS A & B 8 OZ. #S216B POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE [
59 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S216B-8 OZ AZER SCIENTIFIC AZREST777
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 2/8 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 90.00000 $ 45.00000 | $ 164.2100 | $ 164.2100
1% CRYSTAL VIOLET 8 OZ. #S167A POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
60 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S167D-8 OZ NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 26.00000| $ 26.00000 |
0.25 % METANIL YELLOW 8 OZ. #5239 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE!]
61 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S239-8 0Z NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 0Z BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 29.00000 $ 29.00000 |
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POLY SCIENTIFIC MEDLINE
GRAND TOTAL $ 3,666.80000| $ 3,150.00380
FONTANA SILVER NITRATE 8 OZ. #S181S POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE(
62 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC §181S-8 0Z NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 557.00000[ $ 557.00000 |
OIL RED O STAIN KIT 8 OZ. #K043 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTEU
63 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC K043-8 0Z STATLAB MEDICAL PRODUCTS STLBKTORO
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 6/8 0Z BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 211.00000| $ 35.17000 | $ 108.6200 | $ 108.6200
CONGO RED STAIN KIT 8 OZ. #K002 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
64 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC K002-8 0Z STATLAB MEDICAL PRODUCTS STLBSTCREPT
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 3/8 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 148.00000| $ 49.33000 | $ 62.1100 | $ 62.1100
MANUELS RETIC STAIN KIT 8 OZ. #K036 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE(]
65 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC K036-8 OZ AZER SCIENTIFIC AZRES3403
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 6/8 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 1,043.00000 $ 173.83000 | $ 2515400 | $ 251.5400
TRICHROME WITH GREEN 8 OZ. #51815 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
66 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC $1815-8 OZ AZER SCIENTIFIC AZRES868
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 4CS 4CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 74.00000] $ 74.00000 | $ 114.1100 | $ 28.5275
STOCK LIGHT GREEN 8 OS #8232 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE (|
67 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S232-8 0Z NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 25.00000] $ 25.00000 |
BASIC FUCHSEN 0.25 STOCK AQUEOQUS 8 OS #S2011 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
68 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S2011-8 0Z NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 30.00000| $ 30.00000 |
GOLD CHLORIDE, 1%, 80Z., #K047 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
69 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC $203-8 0OZ STATLAB MEDICAL PRODUCTS STLB316004
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 6 PK 6 PK
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 598.00000( $ 598.00000 | $ 1,423.0900 | $ 237.1817
HYDROGEN PEROXIDE 3 % AQUEOUS 16 OZ. #S2142 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
70 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S2142-16 OZ RICCA CHEMICAL COMPANY LLC RCC819100500
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/16 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 31.00000] $ 31.00000 | $ 21.4000 | $ 21.4000
DICHROMATE CLEANING SOLUTION 16 OZ. #5179 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
71 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC §175-16 0Z RICCA CHEMICAL COMPANY LLC RCC2610001C1
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/16 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 37.00000| $ 37.00000 | $ 36.6000 | $ 36.6000
JENNER STAIN STOCK SOLUTION 8 OZ. #5224 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
72 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S224-8 0Z NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 44.00000] $ 44.00000 |
POLYCHROME STAIN FOR FROZEN SECTIONS 8 OZ. #51868 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
73 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S1868- 8 OZ NO BID
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 62.00000| $ 62.00000 |
SOUTH GATE MUCICARMINE 8 OZ. #52161 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
74 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC $2161-8 OZ STATLAB MEDICAL PRODUCTS STLB8O
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 1EA 1EA
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 75.00000] $ 75.00000 | $ 248.6300 | $ 248.6300
0.1 % GOLD CHLORIDE 8 OZ. #5201 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S201-8 OZ
8 PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/8 OZ BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE NO BID
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 214.00000] $ 214.00000 |
EOSIN/PHLOXINE WORKING SOLUTION 1 GAL #S176 POLY SCIENTIFIC, NO SUBSTITUTE
76 BRAND/STK NO POLY SCIENTIFIC S176-1 GL AZER SCIENTIFIC AZRES722
PKG QTY/MIN ORDER 1/1 GAL BOTTLE 1 PACKAGE 4CS 4CS
PKG PRICE/PRICE EACH $ 166.00000 $ 166.00000 | $ 1915100 | $ 47.8775
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POLY SCIENTIFIC MEDLINE

| GRAND TOTAL $ 3,666.80000] $ 3,150.00380
|De|ivery guaranteed not later than __ days after order date.| 5 BUSINESS DAYS | 14 BUSINESS DAYS OR EARLIER |
MAXIMUM DISCOUNT
Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is 0
renewed for 2nd year _0_ %. = 0
Guaranteed maximum discount available if contract is 0
renewed for 3rd year _0_ %. - 0
REQUIRED FORMS
Notification of Intent to Respond YES YES
Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES
EEOC Form YES YES
Affidavit of Contractor YES YES
Debarment Statement YES YES
Signature Page YES YES
Price Sheet YES YES
CONTACT INFORMATION

1 Poly Scientific R & D Corp. 70 Cleveland Avenue, Bay Shore, NY 11706 | Natalie Brereton P: 631.586.0400 E: Nbrereton@PolyRnD.com

2 Medline Industries Three Lakes Drive, Northfiled, IL 60093 | Chris Powers P: 1.800.636.8150 E: govbids@medline.com
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